PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE - SOLID WASTE & RECYCLING
DPW AGENDA
November 24, 2020
Committee Members: CONOVER, Hogan, Leggett, Braymer, Bruno, Magowan, Merlino, Strough, Wild
I Committee meeting called to order by Chair
II. Approval of minutes of prior Committee Meeting
I11. Action Agenda/New Business Items
1. Request: New Contract
Rationale: For Solid Waste, Medical Waste and Recycling Disposals Services
2. Request: New Contract
Rationale: For Solid Waste, Medical Waste and Recycling Disposals Services

Iv. Discussion Items:
1. Local Solid Waste Management Plan - Update

2. Local Law No 2 & 3 of 1991
V. Referrals/Pending Items

VI. Privilege of the floor and public comment (please allow for 15 second delay on live stream

meetings)

VII. Motion to Adjourn

Attachments:



RESOLUTION REQUEST FORM NO. 3

Request for New Contract

DEPARTMENT NAME: County Facilities

DATE: 11/24/2020

(@)

(b)

(©

(d)

(€)
678-1098

(f)

(9)

(h)

extension.

(i)

()

Is this a Result of a Bid or Request for Proposal? Bid WC 57-20

Purpose of Contract: Solid Waste, Medical Waste & Recycling Disposal Services

Name of Contractor: Advo Waste Medical Services, LLC

Address of Contractor: PO Box 356 Lakewood, NJ 08701

Contractor’s Contact Person and Telephone Number: Sarah Novoseller Ph# (855)

Has or will the Contract be provided, if so, please attach:

Commencement Date of Contract: 1/1/2021

Termination Date of Contract: 12/31/2021, with the option of one 1 year

Payment Provisions: i) lump sum amount
i1) hourly rate amount
iii) total amount not to exceed
iv) how will payments be made (i.e. monthly, quarterly,
upon completion of the project, etc.

Where are the Funds for this Contract? List Budget Code, (with title), Object
Code (with title), and Amount: OR _Capital Project OR Capital Reserve Project
Number, and Title, and Amount: Various Budget codes



RESOLUTION REQUEST FORM NO. 3

Request for New Contract

DEPARTMENT NAME: County Facilities

DATE: 11/24/2020

(@)

(b)

(©

(d)

(€)
877-2308

(f)

(9)

(h)

extension.

(i)

()

Is this a Result of a Bid or Request for Proposal? Bid WC 57-20

Purpose of Contract: Solid Waste, Medical Waste & Recycling Disposal Services

Name of Contractor: County Waste & Recycling Service dba Ace Carting

Address of Contractor: 1927 Route 9, Clifton Park, NY 12065

Contractor’s Contact Person and Telephone Number: Mark Ceresa Ph# (518)

Has or will the Contract be provided, if so, please attach:

Commencement Date of Contract: 1/1/2021

Termination Date of Contract: 12/31/2021, with the option of one 1 year

Payment Provisions: i) lump sum amount
i1) hourly rate amount
iii) total amount not to exceed
iv) how will payments be made (i.e. monthly, quarterly,
upon completion of the project, etc.

Where are the Funds for this Contract? List Budget Code, (with title), Object
Code (with title), and Amount: OR _Capital Project OR Capital Reserve Project
Number, and Title, and Amount: Various Budget codes



WARREN COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

NAME & ADDRESS OF | NAME & ADDRESS OF | NAME & ADDRESS OF | NAME & ADDRESS OF
BID NO: WC57-20 BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
ITEM(S): SOLID WASTE, MEDICAL WASTE
AND RECYCLING DISPOSAL SERVICES
) AdvoWaste Medical Stericycle Inc. County Waste & Recycling | Casella Waste Management,
DATE: OCTOBER 27,2020 Services, LLC Attn: Joe Sagala Service dba Ace Carting Inc.
TIME:  3:00 PM Attn: Sarah Novoseller 2355 Waukegan Rd. Attn: Mark Ceresa Attn: John Casella
P PO Box 356 Bannockburn, IL 60015 1927 Route 9 1392 Route 9

Lakewood, NJ 08701 Ph: 866-978-3744 Clifton Park, NY 12065 Fort Edward, NY 12828
Ph: 855-678-1098 Fx: 800-507-8052 Ph: 518-877-2308 Ph: 518-480-2531
Fx: N/a Fx: 518-877-7337 Fx: 518-792-3318

BID AWARDED TO: TERM: JANUARY 1, 2021 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2021

v RESOLUTION NO. XX OF 2020

JULIE A. BUTLER, PURCHASING AGENT

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE

SITE #1- WARREN COUNTY MUNICIPAL CENTER

#1a, PUBLIC HEALTH: Collection/Disposal of infectious waste. Every other month | $39.00/box $42.00/box No Bid No Bid

service within 48 hours. Approximately 6 times per year with additional pickups during | Size: 4.5 cubic ft. Size: Size: 4.5 cubic ft.

flu season as needed.

#1b. LOADING DOCK: Pick up and disposal of 8 cu. yd. cardboard container once a | No Bid No Bid $103.92/per month $120.00/per month

week ONFRIDAY and subject to additional pick-ups if deemed necessary by the County.

Price per ton for disposal: No Bid No Bid Included Included

SITE #2 - WARREN COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

SITE #2a: SHERIFF’S OFFICE: Warren County Correctional Facility infectious $39.00/box $42.00/box No Bid No Bid

medical waste to be picked up every 2 weeks on a set schedule to be provided to the | Size: 4.5 cubic f. Size: Size: 4.5 cubic ft.

facility by the successful bidder. Approximately 26 times per year.

SITE 2b: SHERIFF’S OFFICE: Rental price per month for one 35 cu. yd trash No Bid No Bid $125.00/month $300.00/month

container with bi-weekly pick up and disposal. $150.00/haul $150.00/haul

$79.00/ton $85.00/ton

RECYCLABLES: Rental per month for one recycling container 8 cu. yd. with bi- No Bid No Bid $51.96/month $65.00/month

weekly pick up and disposal. $50.00/cleaning No Bid for Cleaning

SITE #3: COUNTRYSIDE ADULT HOME

SITE #3a: COUNTRYSIDE ADULT HOME: Countryside Adult Home infectious | $39.00/box $42.00/box No Bid No Bid

medical waste to be picked up on a quarterly basis. Approximately 4 times per year.

Size: 4.5 cubic ft.

Size: Size: 4.5 cubic ft.




NAME & ADDRESS OF | NAME & ADDRESSOF | NAME & ADDRESSOF | NAME & ADDRESS OF
BID NO: WC57-20 BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
ITEM(S): SOLID WASTE, MEDICAL WASTE
AND RECYCLING DISPOSAL SERVICES .
) AdvoWaste Medical Stericycle Inc. County Waste & Recycling | Casella Waste Management,
DATE: OCTOBER 27,2020 Services, LLC Attn: Joe Sagala Service dba Ace Carting Inc.
TIME:  3:00 P.M Attn: Sarah Novoseller 2355 Waukegan Rd. Attn: Mark Ceresa Attn: John Casella
G PO Box 356 Bannockburn, IL 60015 1927 Route 9 1392 Route 9
Lakewood, NJ 08701 Ph: 866-978-3744 Clifton Park, NY 12065 Fort Edward, NY 12828
Ph: 855-678-1098 Fx: 800-507-8052 Ph: 518-877-2308 Ph: 518-480-2531
Fx: N/a Fx: 518-877-1337 Fx: 518-792-3318
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
#3b. ALTERNATIVE 1: Rental for one dumpster container 8 cu. yds. Pick up and No Bid No Bid $346.74 No Bid
disposal THREE times per week on MONDAYS, WEDNESDAYS and FRIDAYS.
#3b. ALTERNATIVE 2: Rental for one dumpster container 8 cu. yds. Pickupand | No Bid No Bid $234.16 $360.00/month
disposal TWO times per week on agreed upon days.
RECYCLABLES: Three 96 gallon containers No Bid No Bid Included $30.00
95 Gallon Container
SITE #4: BOLTON MEALSITE: Use of one dumpster and removal of No Bid No Bid $66.62 $65.00/month
approximately 2 cu. yards waste one time per week
RECYCLABLES: Two 96 gallon containers No Bid No Bid Included $20.00
95 Gallon Container
SITE #5: FLOYD BENNETT MEMORIAL AIRPORT: Use of one 96 gallon trash | No Bid No Bid $18.00 $20.00
container once per week on Mondays
RECYCLABLES: One 96 gallon container No Bid No Bid Included $10.00
95 Gallon Container
C & D DISPOSAL: No Bid No Bid $75.00 No Bid
TIRES: No Bid No Bid $125.00 No Bid
Car and small truck tires only
ADDRESS FOR TRANSPORTING: N/a N/a Ace Carting N/a
10913 Route 149

Fort Ann, NY 12827




